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   A  Place to Belong!   

            A  Place to Grow! 



 

  

May 23, 2020 
Church Connect Events... 

https://paradiseadventist.zoom.us/j/97168844409?pwd=WVVGMjBkQmk0V28xSkhYT28vcUtTQT09
https://www.facebook.com/paradiseadventist/
mailto:paradiseadventist.org


 

 

May 23, 2020 
Church Life 



 

  

May 23, 2020 
Church Life 

Many of our Elders will be contributing to the visitation responsibilities  
on behalf of our Pastoral Staff. In case of emergency this weekend,  

please call the Elder-On-Call: 
Devon Horning (530.873.9289)  



 

 

 

 

 

Our Church Family Budget, the PAC Ministries Fund, provides for all 
our day-to-day expenses, including our portion of the Operating Funds for 
the PAA High School and, starting in August, the PAE (Paradise 
Elementary School).  Please note that a budget is only good if it is funded 
—and that’s where you come in!  Each church member family should 
consider it a privilege to partner in the financial support of our 
commitments to the schools ($26,500 each month to PAA and later 
$8,333 per month to PAE) plus other church expenses (i.e. Utilities, 
Insurance, Salaries, Adventurers and Pathfinders, Sabbath School 
Expense, Youth/Children’s/Intergenerational Ministries, etc.).  As you 
can see from the graph below, we are averaging right around $41,400 in 
total budget expenses each month.  However, our monthly donations are 
falling far short of that. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

We understand that these are difficult times for many families with the 
Coronavirus causing  many layoffs.  But for those of us who still remain 
employed, we ask that you prayerfully consider increasing your monthly 
contribution to our Church Budget, even if it’s just $10 per month; some 
may be able to do more.  If we all pull together our combined sacrifices 
can ensure our success in providing Christian Education for our children 
and the community, while we continue serving the Ridge as the hands 
and feet of Jesus! 

PAC Monthly Budget 
 



 

  



 

 

http://www.paradiseadventistchurch.org


 

  

 

 

Night and day I constantly  

remember you in my prayers. 

 2 Timothy 1:3 

 

We rejoice with Steve and Cindy Arrington as their property comes 

back to life. Thank you so much for sharing photos of the wildflowers 

on your property.  

Front and back cover photos are a courtesy of Steve Arrington 


